It 4. S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

y

Che Gazette of India

O1.5.-21.Te.-31.-01042022-234795
CG-DL-E-01042022-234795

AETETIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT 11— 3—I9-GUe (ii)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

T F THAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

g, 1502] T3 faeett, AT, 18« 1, 2022/ 11, 1944
No. 1502] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, APRIL 1, 2022/CHAITRA 11, 1944
SERIENKEIEET
(SreraaTe, T s i Ster e fawmT)

75 foeett, 1 arder, 2022

T, 1563(3T).— Frai T TLHTT o SATeT a9 T Arer=a#, 2014 (2014 F7 6) (57 za# =&
AT IFT ATTHIT Fgl TAT g) =l 1T 85 T ITETT (1) FIT Ve ATFIAT FHT TN Fd g, aE
28 9, 2014 T FOUT TaT T dre (B a8 THaH T9ATG HLUHAT gl AT 8) FT TS AT AT 3T
Fg Ut TRATSHTS ST e FETE gIT Ategi=a it 1w, & vered, Ffaawe, sqear 6w y=e+ %
forw 3aw Sfeated Fet 1 91ad we & o0 2 S, 2014 | Tre gei o ;

I ATATH=TH AT 1T 87 F ITETT (1) Fg STATET FLAl g 1o Al ATITOAAT Hag ST Al
ST AT TR T T&TT A & o0 a9 dq® S o1 o (ST, a7e, SAners, ﬁﬁ'&ﬂ%ﬁﬁ'ﬁﬁr)a{{ BECED
F AT TAT IO ATSAT 9 3T FRATSTA 8 F FBFeft 3 are § vt srferaprRar 1 w=em s S =0
LAY G Ao Ta0 9o faare Afaf=aw, 1956 F refiq wisa srferswon grey fhu o srfarfaot,
7f% 1 2T, F e st i 9w ;

of i gfius F A 6 ST, 2020 FT AT AIAT S5 § TETa<T Tat TG I 37T FHEor
TET TFGA TS IAT T SATSRTAT T ST FeeA 1 (A e T § ol TEqATE, Feald Geae 7 3
srferfaae it 9T 87 Fit ITLTT (1) BT Tacd Tl &1 TINT Fd g, ATEAAT &, T3, 2842 (31),
AT 15 T, 2021 (Fr&r =87 =0 7991 FAUHST ATAFTRAT STER=AT 77 TAT §) FTT FOUT Tar
U ATHRTIAT T TN F4 o T wemeuwedt v srferpriear & sriamgf=ra o o,

2341 G1/2022 1)




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(ii)]

I FALTHAT ATAFRTIAT ATELAAT % 97 1 F ©T (3) F ATEL H 6 TR T A & A5
& T srater o iqe, sfer TR9T Si¥ qeTHT ToF il TR &7 |I FIE TIU il Uk 9 TIHE T T2
FAT T FACTHST 9% GTA T STHAT FII(T, ST HATTTHAST 7 3799 FTAT T TATIT F2F § TH T3,

T FHARTHAT ATHIAT ATGHAT F T 2 FT G (F) Tg U FdT g o FqAqeIea
TRATSHETSAT 9% qUId: IT AT 9 T HAT H, (S Hls gl TATAT U (&7 ST, S IFq FoAeadar
STERTIAT STTEEEAT o THTAT % TLATA g Ho o il AT o HIAL FATHIGT T Tal H (T ATar g ;

I HALTHAT STEHTILAT SATEEAAT & U7 2 T G (F) TE AT TS FLAT § 190 IAT T5T AL
THE THTIF 6T ATEE T g A= 6 ¥ IFq AT == & It F qqame o< offd gfug £ @it s
# forw o e F aqE geaited o SqAIed/Aqaned TRATSHTe w1 T F00 e g UEr
AIHIET Fg Al Al Faq afd & Hae dai areq Fa1 Srar &, a7 U q7 AqAred TRArsHra ot
AT &% 1 ST

T FALTHAT ATALAAT % TT 1 F @ (3) F ST F HATAAT I Tq T AL TILT AT
AT T Gt (S T8 28 T9ATq T ST gl TAT g) & a1 FF=me-fEmet e i g &
7g 9+t TF IFT TR Al F A F

T HATHAT ATHAAT o I 2 F @ (F) 3T G (F) F ST F HITeaAT 0l SR A7 ¥
TAFRIT TTT o AT § 3T TMET T5T qETE 7 Heal T GEhlT 8 IFT TGl & HA7adqd o [0
THT FETH T ST 0T &7 |

A, T, Feald AL, IFq ATANTH sl &7 87 il 1T 1 FIT T&<d Tiaadl T TIRT Fd g,
I FACTHST SATEIHRTAT STTEGAAT T FFATATET ST FATeT FAT g, TAT(-

I HACTHST SATEHTAT STTE=AT H -
(F) T 1 % @2 (3) |, "1 &A1 oTeal % T 9T “Ueh q9” 968 T AT,
(@) T 2 F -
(i) @< (F) ®, “Bg A" Tea1 & ST 9T “UF a9 i A8 6 T ST,
(i) @< (F) #, “Tg A" Teal gl Fal o AT 8, % LI 9L “TF qU~° 9058 T S0 |
[T, &, &M7-22012/1/2021-47. Re. Ge-uHs= = me-wr(3)]
feoqur:  IFq FeRUHST ATUREAT ARG F TSI, STETHT, AR 1, G 3, ITEE (i) § aAferg=ar €.
T, 2842(3), ATLE 15 FJATE, 2021 FTIT THTIAT AT T8

MINISTRY OF JAL SHAKTI
(Department of Water Resources, River Development and Ganga Rejuvenation)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st April, 2022

S.0. 1563(E).—Whereas, in pursuance of the powers conferred under sub-section (1) of section 85
of the Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation Act, 2014 (6 of 2014) (hereafter referred to as the said Act), the
Central Government on 28" May, 2014 constituted the Krishna River Management Board (hereafter
referred to as the KRMB) and the same became effective on 2™ June, 2014 to perform the functions
mentioned therein for the administration, regulation, maintenance and operation of projects as may be
notified by the Central Government;

And whereas, sub-section (1) of section 87 of the said Act provides that the Board shall ordinarily
exercise jurisdiction on Krishna river in regard to any of the projects over head works (barrages, dams,
reservoirs, regulating structures), part of canal network and transmission lines necessary to deliver water or



[¢TRT I1—=ve 3(ii)] T T TSI © T 3

power to the States concerned, as may be notified by the Central Government, having regard to the awards,
if any, made by the Tribunals constituted under the Inter-State River Water Disputes Act, 1956;

And whereas, in its 2™ meeting of the Apex Council, held on 6™ October, 2020, it has been decided
to notify the jurisdiction of both Godavari River Management Board and Krishna River Management Board
and accordingly, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 87 of the said Act, the
Central Government notified the jurisdiction of the KRMB to exercise the jurisdiction on Krishna river vide
notification number S.O. 2842 (E), dated the 15" July, 2021 (hereafter referred to as the KRMB jurisdiction
notification);

And whereas, in pursuance of clause (I) of paragraph 1 of the said KRMB jurisdiction notification,
within a period of sixty days from the date of its publication, the State Governments of Andhra Pradesh and
Telangana shall provide one-time seed money of an amount of rupees two hundred crore each and be
deposited in the KRMB bank account to enable the KRMB to discharge its functions effectively;

And whereas, clause (f) of paragraph 2 of the said KRMB jurisdiction notification provides that the
ongoing works on unapproved projects, full or partial if any, shall cease to operate if approvals are not
obtained within a period of six months after the publication of the said KRMB jurisdiction notification,;

And whereas, clause (g) of paragraph 2 of the said KRMB jurisdiction notification also provides that
within six months from the date of its publication, both State Governments shall complete the unapproved
projects appraised and approved as per the provisions of the said Act and in accordance with the decisions
taken in the 2" meeting of the Apex Council; and if the said approvals are not obtained within the
stipulated time of six months, such completed unapproved projects shall cease to operate;

And whereas, the progress of implementation of the provisions of clause (1) of paragraph 1 of the
said KRMB jurisdiction notification has been discussed with the State Governments of Andhra Pradesh and
Telangana (hereafter referred to as the party States) and the same is still under consideration of the said
party States;

And whereas, the progress of implementation of the provisions of clauses (f) and (g) of paragraph 2
of the said KRMB jurisdiction notification is also still under consideration by the party States and the State
Government of Telangana requested the Central Government for extension of time for implementation of
the said provisions.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 87 of the said Act,
the Central Government hereby makes the following amendments in the said KRMB jurisdiction
notification, namely:—

In the said KRMB jurisdiction notification,—

(@) in paragraph 1, in clause (1), for the words “sixty days”, the words “one year” shall be
substituted:;

(b) in paragraph 2,—
(1) in clause (f), for the words “six months”, the words “a period of one year” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (g), for the words “six months”, wherever they occur, the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

[F. No. R-22012/1/2021-Pen Riv Section-MOWR-Part (3)]
SANJAY AWASTHI, Jt. Secy.

Note : The KRMB jurisdiction notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I,
Section 3, Sub-section (ii), vide notification number S.O. 2842 (E), dated thel15th July, 2021.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. MaNO) KuMAl




		2022-04-01T23:04:07+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




